SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION
JULY 11, 2022
MINUTES

STATE OF ALABAMA
COUNTY OF SHELBY

The Shelby County Commission of Shelby County, Alabama, met at the County Administration Building in
the City of Columbiana, Alabama, at 8:30 A.M., Monday, July 11, 2022. The meeting was called to order
by Commissioner Morris. The invocation was given followed by the Pledge of Allegiance. Roll was called
and the following members were present:

PRESENT

Commissioner Lindsey Allison
Commissioner Elwyn Bearden
*Commissioner Robbie Hayes
Commissioner Kevin Morris
Commissioner Jon Parker
Commissioner Mike Vest
Commissioner Ward Williams

ABSENT
Commissioner Tommy Edwards
Commissioner Rick Shepherd

*Commissioner Hayes entered the meeting at 8:42 a.m.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF JUNE 27, 2022
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-01

MOTION: Commissioner Allison - Motion to approve the Minutes from June 13, 2022 as presented
SECOND:  Commissioner Williams
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

APPROVAL OF BILLS, REQUISITIONS, AND CHECK REGISTER
GOVERNMENTAL FUNDS AND PROPRIETARY FUNDS
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-02



MOTION: Commissioner Williams — Motion to approve the Bills, Requisitions and Check
Register for Government and Proprietary Funds
SECOND: Commissioner Parker
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED
COMMISSIONER HAYES ENTERED MEETING

BUDGET, FINANCE & LEGAL
BID AWARD - VEHICLE EQUIPMENT & INSTALLATION
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-03

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-03 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Bearden
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-03

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Sheriff’s Office Vehicle Equipment
to the only responsive bidder, Dana Safety Supply as attached.

Said eBid 2022-6-11275 is located within the County Manager’s Office.

BID AWARD — UNIFORM AND DUTY GEAR
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-04

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-04 as presented

SECOND: Commissioner Hayes
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-04

BE IT RESOLVED, the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Sheriff’s Office Uniform
and Duty Gear to the only responsive bidder, MAC Uniform as attached.

Said eBid 2022-6-11276 is located within the County Manager’s Office.

BID AWARD - BILL PRINT AND MAIL SERVICE
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-05

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-05 as presented

SECOND:  Commissioner Hayes

VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-05

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Bill Print and Mail
Services to the lowest responsive bidder, DATAprose as shown below:



Annual Cost based on 13,500 bills (not
including postage)

DATAprose 5 14,580.00
Financial Imaging S 17,820.00
Standard Printing Company 5 18,306.00
Peregrine Solutions S 18,630.00
Infosend S 20,250.00
PCI 5 47,142.00

Said eBid 2022-6-11277 is located in the County Manager’s Office.

AWARD BID - PAVEMENT REHABILITATION - AIRPORT
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-06

MOTION:
SECOND:

VOTE ON MOTION:

Unanimous

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-06

Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-06 as presented
Commissioner Vest

MOTION CARRIED

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission requested bids for the Shelby County

Pavement Rehabilitation Project and received two responsive bids as follows:

Total Base Bid

& All
BIDDER Total Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternates
Ameriseal of Ohio, Inc. $220,975.00 $38,496.80 $259,471.80
Dortch, Figures & Sons, Inc. $252,820.20 $43,296.40 $296,116.60

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the base bid and
alternate one to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, Ameriseal of Ohio, Inc. in
the amount of $259.471.80.

Said eBid #2022-4-11257 is located within the County Manager's Office.

AWARD BID — RESIDENTIAL GARBAGE COLLECTION & RECYCLING
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-07

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-07 as presented




SECOND: Commissioner Hayes

VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-07

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Residential Garbage
Collection and Recycling to the lowest responsive bidder, Waste Management. The effective date of the
new bid will be October 1, 2022.

Residential Garbage Collection and Recycling Bid Results June 21, 2022

. Amwaste
Repu.bllc GFL Waste Amwaste (*Alternate
y Services Management .
Service Bid)
Gatbage Residential | NOBID | $23.12 $20.69 $32.00 $28.00
Garb Residential 11
aroage sesidenta NOBID | $32.95 $31.04 $60.00 $54.00
GazbapeResidential Il NOBID | $40.00 $30.69 $54.00 $50.00
g, Vet NOBID | $20.00 $137.51 $19.00 $19.00
Bid Alternate A — Curbside I;IO g -
Recycling S
NO BID NO BID NO BID Bid NO BID
Bid Alternate B — Community
Recycling Bins NOBID | $900.00 $500.00 $605.00 $605.00

RESOLVED, the County Manager is hereby directed to execute the associated contract and proceed with
any actions associated with this matter.

Said Ebid # 2022-6-11274 is located within the County Manager’s Office.

LEGISLATIVE COMMITTEE APPOINTMENT
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-08

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-22-08 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Vest
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-08

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby nominates Commissioner Kevin Morris to
the 2022-2023 ACCA Legislative Committee.

5311 RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING MATCHING FUNDS - CLASTRAN




RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-09
MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-09 as presented

SECOND: Commissioner Vest
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

Resolution Authorizing Local Matching Funds

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-09

SECTION 5311 RURAL AREA PUBLIC TRANSPORTATION

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission recognizes the need for a public transportation
program; and

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission is an active member of the Birmingham Regional
Paratransit Consortium, (ClasTran), created to execute the vision of the Metropolitan Planning Organization
(MPO), and Jefferson / Shelby Rural Transportation Steering Committee; to organize, coordinate and
implement a regional public and specialized transportation service for the region; and

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission recognizes that the requirements to obtain Federal
Transit Administration (FTA) Section 5311 funds through recipient, the Alabama Department of
Transportation (ALDOT), requires a local match of 50% for operating expenses and 20% for administration,
capital expenses and the purchase of transportation services for rural transportation (Section 5311); and

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission recognizes that the local match will be a shared cost
with other participating agencies, counties and municipalities being responsible for providing an appropriate
allocation of local non-federal funds to secure the operating of Section 5311 Rural Transportation Program.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby commits
the amount of $130,733.00 within Fiscal Year 2023 County’s general fund for ClasTran to use as the
applicable local match for the capital, administrative and operational expenditures under the Section 5311
Rural Public Transportation Program during Fiscal Year 2023. The County Manager is directed to perform
any necessary actions associated with these programs.

This signature shall denote that this is a certified copy of the Resolution 22-07-11-09 approved at the Shelby
County Commission meeting on July 11, 2022.



5311 Local Match Certification

The Shelby County Commission representing Shelby County,

hereby certifies to the Alabama Department of Transportation that the required local funds for the
Birmingham Regional Paratransit Consortium dba/ Clastran Public Transportation Program are available
from the following source(s):

General Fund: $130,490.00
Contracts: $ 243.00
Other/Advertising: $
Other: $
Total: $130,733.00

These funds will be available as of October 1, 2022.

PLANNING AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
ALCOHOL BEVERAGE LICENSE - BESITOS MEXICAN RESTAURANT
RESOLUTION 2022-11-07-10

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-10 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Hayes
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-10

CASE NO. A22-007, BESITOS MEXICAN KITCHEN
TRANSFER - 020 RESTAURANT RETAIL LIQUOR

WHEREAS, Ariel Vicars, Besitos Mexican Kitchen LLC, has submitted documentation in support of a
transfer application request for an 020-Restaurant Retail Liquor license from Canh and Vu Pho 280, LLC to
Besitos Mexican Kitchen, LLC for the Besitos Mexican Kitchen located at 5479 Hwy 280, Suite 102,
Birmingham, AL 35242, and,

WHEREAS, Besitos Mexican Kitchen is zoned B-2, General Business District and subject to the Zoning
Ordinance of Shelby County, and,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that an application by Ariel Vicars, Besitos Mexican Kitchen
LLC, for a transfer of 020 — Restaurant Retail Liquor license for Besitos Mexican Kitchen to permit the



Retail sale of alcohol at a restaurant is hereby approved.

NEW ALCOHOL BEVERAGE FEES
RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-11

MOTION: Commissioner Allison — Motion to approve Resolution 2022-07-11-11 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Hayes
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-11

WHEREAS, The Alabama Legislature recently passed alcohol laws that resulted in the creation of two (2)
license types to be issued by the Alabama ABC Board. The new license types have been established by the
Board, but now require local action regarding Shelby County wet county alcohol license fees; and,

WHEREAS, ACT #2022-360 Hospitality Management Program is specifically for any state university that
operates a school or college that offers bachelors or associate degrees in Hospitality Management,
Hospitality Sciences, Hotel Management, Event Management, Restaurant Management, or Culinary
Sciences. A Hospitality Management Program license may be issued to the state university upon whose
property the licensed premises is located or to a third party licensee of the board that has contracted with the
state university to perform the licensed activities on the premises located on the state university campus. A
state university means a public two-year institution of higher education that has its own campus police
department or a four-year institution of higher education; and,

WHEREAS, ACT #2022-432 Food or Beverage Truck is specifically to provide for a food or beverage
truck license in Class 1 municipalities that would allow a food or beverage truck to sell alcoholic beverages
for consumption in open containers within an area designated by the municipal governing authority within
an established entertainment district; and to require the Alcoholic Beverage Control Board to adopt rules;
and,

WHEREAS, Class 1 municipality is defined as all cities with a population of 300,000 inhabitants or more;
and,

WHEREAS, ACT #2022-432 for a class 1 municipality with an established entertainment district does not
apply in Shelby County.

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission establishes the following fees:

COUNTY (58) SHELBY 2022-2023

TYPE LICENSE & | FILING | STATE COUNTY RENEWAL | NEW

CODE FEE LICENSE | LICENSE TOTAL LICENSE
FEE FEE TOTAL

Hospitality Management $50.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $1,550.00

Program License

Food or Beverage Truck $50.00 | $300.00 NA $300.00 $350.00

License




MOTION TO ADJOURN
RESOLUTION 2022-06-13-12

MOTION: Commissioner Hayes — There being no further business to come before the Commission,
move to adjourn this 11™ day of July, 2022 at 9:09 A.M.

SECOND:  Commissioner Parker

VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

READ & APPROVED:

COMMISSIONER LINDSEY ALLISON

COMMISSIONER ELWYN BEARDEN

COMMISSIONER TOMMY EDWARDS

COMMISSIONER ROBBIE HAYES

COMMISSIONER KEVIN MORRIS

COMMISSIONER JON PARKER

COMMISSIONER RICK SHEPHERD

COMMISSIONER MIKE VEST

COMMISSIONER WARD WILLIAMS



Specifications for Shelby County Sheriff's Office
2022 Marked and Unmarked Sheriff's Office Vehicle Equipment and
Installation

The Shelby County Sheriff's Office shall have the sole right to determine if all
requirements have been net.

The winning bidder must be ready to start installation of all vehicles within 30 days of
notification that they have been awarded the bid for these vehicles and within 30 days of
delivery and receipt of any future vehicles and equipment for the vehicies. This will be
contingent upon delivery of vehicles from the manufacturers; the Sheriff's Office will provide
projected delivery dates to the bidder as provided by vehicle manufacturers upon request.
Installer must be able to complete a minimum of 3 vehicles per week from the start date. If the
winning bidder fails to deliver complete services during this established time frame punitive
damages will be assessed. If the project is not complete by the third day past the estimated end
date, a two percent reduction in the total project cost will be deducted from the final bill. In
addition for every seven days following that the project is not compiete another two percent
(cumulative) reduction in the total project cost will be deducted from the final bill.

Understand and comply with specifications overview Requirements / No (circle
one)

[n Addition to the equipment specified in this bid. each bid submitted must include a percentage
off of manufacturer's list price for each manufacturer's entire line of products with the
following:

We hereby propose to furnish the below described commodity in accordance with the bid
packuge. the undersigned offers the following for balance of line for the listed MFG:

*+ Discounted pricing shall be proposed for the following list of manufacturers.
Products or equipment to be purchased will be manufacturer specific. No
substitutions will beaccepted.

*  Pricing shall be considered as % off of manufacturer's list price.

L. Whelen Emergency Lighting 25 % Discount
2. Sound Off Signal 51 % Discount
3. Go-Rhino Products 20 % Discount
4. Havis Equipment 35 % Discount
5. Able2 40 % Discount
6. Progard 25 % Discount
7. Kustom Signals 11 % Discount
8. Jotto Mfg. 20 % Discount
9. Gamber Johnson 38 % Discount
10. Setina 28 % Discount




Specifications for Shelby County Sheriff's Office
2022 Marked and Unmarked Sheriff's Office Vehicle Equipment and

[nstallation

The following items will be provided by the successful vendor and required for installation.

Manufacturer Part Number Description Q | Bid Cost

Havis C-VSW-1005-TAH-PM Console 11%$525.00

Havis CUP2-1001 Internal Cup Holder 11$41.00

Havis C-ARM-102 Armrest 11$51.00

Havis CG-X Chargeguard Select 11$62.00

Havis DS-DELL-426 Dell Latitude 5414 Docking Station | 1 | $604.00

Havis C-ADP-101 Multi Laptop Adapter Plate 1] $32.00

Gamber Johnson 7180-0341 Locking Swing Arm 11%$139.00
Gamber Johnson 7160-0177 Center Upper Pole 11$61.00

Gamber Johnson 0S-138 Universal Vertical Base 11%51.00

Kustom Signals 001-3022-00 Eagle 3 RADAR W/DUAL KA 11$2.700.00
SoundOff ECVDMLTALOO LED Dome light 1]$63.00

Sound Off ENNLB0O0SJ2-27P |NFORCE NXT 54° LIGHTBAR 1

BW/BW FRONT BA/BA REAR $1,635.00

Whelen WEC-295SL.SA6 100/200W Siren 1] $365.00

Whelen SA315P 100W Speaker 1{ $145.00
Whelen SAK70 Speaker Mount 1] $20.00
SoundOff EMPS2QMS3B mPower 4" BLED Quick Mount Blue |4 | $104.00 per ligh
SoundOff ENT3B3B Intersector Surface Mount Light Blue | 2| $146.00 per ligh
SoundOff PMP2BKUMBS-D Driver Intersector Bkt 1] $2400
SoundOff PMP2BKUMBS5-P Passenger Intersector Bkt 1] $24.00
SoundOff ENFSGS38 SGL Nforce Deck 12 LED Blue | 2| $122.00 per liah:
SoundOff ENFRMS2B SGL Nforce Push Bumper 9 LED Blue | 2 | $83.00 per light
SoundOff ENFWB00ESS Tahoe Rear Interior BarBlue | 1| $625.00
SoundOff EMPS1QMS1B mPower 3" 4LED Quick Mount Blue 6| $64 .00 per light
SoundOff EMPS20MS38B mPower 4" 8LED Quick Mount Blue | 4 | $86.00 per liaht
Setina QK2024TAH21 Tahoe Transport Seat Poly Window | 1

Center Pull Seat Belis $1.125.00
Setina WHKO514TAH21H Window Barrier Stezl 11 $215.00
Setina PK0O355TAH21 #10VS Recessed Partition Sliding Poly | 1 | $675.00
Go Rhino 5168A-2L Push Bumper 2Light Soundoff nForce | 1| $399.00
Go Rhino 5168WHDT Heavy Duty Wrap Textured 1] $355.00
Go Rhino 2L51A-M1 Push Bumper LR Mask 1] $38.00
Larsen NMOKHFUD25 0-6GHz %" Mount 25 FT Antenna | 1{_$42.00
Magnetic Mic MMSU-1 Magnetic Microphone Holder 11 $30.00
ProGard GVPM4713-002 Vertical Mount Gun Lock 1] $518.00
Shop supplies Miscellaneous shop supplies 1| $150.00
Installation Labor Install of all above and below 11 $1.895.00
G
1 $14,455.25



SHELBY COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE UNIFORM BID SPECIFICATIONS

Description Brand Styleft Color Material Sizes Specs Vendor Price
K5170LC,
K5178LC, .
Class B- Female Short Sleeve Polo Elbeco K5171LC, S“::::EZ’;EZ‘:'E::V Polyester XS-4XL See page 1-2 E/éy(’-(__o SR
K5177LC,
K5172LC
K5130, KS138, | White, Black, Tan, -
Class B - Male Short Sleeve Polo Elbeco K5131, K5135, | Red, Gray, Spruce Polyester XS-6XL See page 3-4 B 2L8.90
K5137, K5132 Green
o . 79812-3LC, | .. _ -

Class A - Fernale Short Sleeve Shirt Elbeco 79812-3LC Silver tan, White Poly/Rayon 30-48 See page 5-7 -t e an
Class B - Male Short Sleeve Shirt Elbeco 2233331120% Silver tan, White Poly/Rayon 14-18.5 See page 8-10 1 "-['—! a0
Class A - Female Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco 29912-3LE, Silver tan, White Poly/Rayon 30-48 See page 11-13 “ e a0

79310-3LC B
Class B - Male Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco 22'3;11201%‘ Silver tan, White Paoly/Rayon 14-18.5 See page 14-16 w L{' G.o0
Class B - Undervest Short Sleeve Shirt Elbeco uvsiia Silver tan Polyester S-4XL See page 17-19 “ 250
Class B - Undervesi -Lung Sleeve Shirt Elbeco UVvSs113 Silver tan Polyester S-SXL See page 20-22 ] d\. oD
Class B - Female Cargo Pants Elbeca E9615LCN Brown Polyester/Cotton 24-Feb See page 23-25 il (0. 00
' Class B - Male Cargo Pants Elbeco E615RN Brown Polyester/Cotton 28-52 See page 26-29 b {oS.00
‘C!ass B - Training/Off-Duty Uniform Pants 511, sTlrr:l:::ec or Tan, Khaki Paly/cotton Poly/rayon Usual male and female sizes See page 30-31 7;4.& Spt-'_.c. g, oo
' Rain Jacket Gerber 70W3/L Lime Green HiVis Variety of sizes for men and women | See page 32-24 (me ,—L_;W LG . 90
Atimin facket Port Authority LJ;:S(({:;::;]:;) Black Variety of sizes See page 35-26 /‘ZHL A&.Cﬁ\ Yo
Winter Quterwear/Jacket Elbeco SH3500 Black Polyester/Spandex XS-axL See page 37-39 | & / {-,Qc_g 120,20
Body Shield External Vest Carrier Elbeco va112 Tan Polyester A5:anL. Stg::é ?::;:;r(’);:'gifnd = See page 10-43 i 100,00
Suspension System Elbeco VSS1 Black Poly/Latex Web Unisex o 25,00
Class A - Female 4-Pocket Pants Elbeco E9315LC Brown Textured Polyester 24-Feb See page 44-26 il Y. Q0
Class A -Male 4-Pocket Pants Elbeco E315 Brown Textured Polyester 28-52 See page 47-49 & .00
Class A - Male Dress Coat Anchor 210 Black Polyester/Wool 36-60 Short, Regular, Long ,4,-\.;/19/‘ ZS0.0c
Class A - Female Dress Coat Anchor 710 Black Polyester/Wool 0-28 Short, Regular, Long -~ 290, o
Class A - Dress Shirt Button Down White Polyester or Cotton Usual sizes for males and fernales Southecste | 25-00
Class A - Male Dress Trousers Anchor 230 Black Polyester/Wool 28-60 Short, Regular, Long /.J.,l c brew GG, 00
Class A - Fernale Dress Trousers Anchor 730 Black Polyester/Wool 0-28 Short, Regular, Long (2 99 GO
Class A - Tie Samuel Broome 90080 Brown, Black Polyester Senn Bvooud (600
Class A - Tie Tack/Lapel Pin Blackington Gold Higle Rl,cu:.‘g;m '!'cn-, Y. 00
Class A - Campaign Hat Stratton F-40 Brown Variety of sizes S4ve~tTton /RS o
Class A - Hat Strap Stratton ST-3P-BK Black Leather i =00
Class A - Acorn Stratton CD-GC Gold o . o0
Class A - Hat cover Stratton RC-MP-MED Clear - GL.co




Class A -Dress Uniform Hat Mg:)\:’na:a;ip Airforce Black Polyester All sizes MJM\_/ ©5.00
Hat Badge Blackington Gold Higlo g[a_(_é,,—, .f-o,., ISOH.00
Duty Belt Safariland 94-4 Black Leather/Basketweave ‘;chin levnd] So.00
. Bel Safariland 99-4 Black Leather/Basketweave 4 “2.00
Handcuff Case Safariland 90':‘:?;09:'90 Black Leather/Basketweave m 2\, 5o
Handcuff Case Safariland 090H, 090-18 Black Leather/Basketweave " 2). 30
Flashlight Holder Safariland 306-11-4 Black Leather/Basketweave t 21.80
Magazine Pouch Safariland 77-83-4HS Black Leather/Basketweave " 2.00
OC/CS Spray Holder Safariland 38-3-4 Black Leather/Basketweave 1 Ao, &0
Belt Keeper Safariland 62-4-4HS Black Leather/Basketweave i o5, 00
Glove Holder Safariland 33-3-4HS Black Leather/Basketweave ¥ 2. fo
Radio Holder Safariland 761-5-4 Black Leather/Basketweave “ 5.00
i Mégazine Pouch Safariland 775-83-4 Black Leather/Basketweave I (. GO
Magazine Pouch Safariland 79-83-4 Black Leather/Basketweave v 21.50
~ Baton Ring Safariland 6925-4PBL Black Leather/Basketweave t4 1 8., a0
Baton Holder Safariland 35-F26-4 Black Leather/Basketweave “ R, GO
Sidebreak baton holder ASP SAL3AT Black Basketweave 26" tqsp (7. &0
Autolock front baton holder Monadnock | 3O Black Basketweave 26" Mor'l L 34 a0
. Top draw baton holder Monadnock RTPSEN Black Basketweave 26" A 37.850
@O Friction lock expandable baton ASP S A\ \ Black 26" ﬂ-sp L #0. o
l Autolock expandable baton Monadnock ALy Black 26" O;LC&A(‘)CE 1S, 8O
Flashlight holder Gould & Goodrich [Nt - T Black Basketweave wﬂaéf{? 2. 0O
Flashlight holder Hems;_::::e or M < Black Basketweave 2 2LeD
Flashlight holder Akerorsimilar | A (g =% Black Basketweave Sler 2. 00
Duty Holster Safariland 7TS ALS/SLS Black Leather/ Basketweave Glock 17 Scafer et lang] 1o, 0o
Handcuffs Peerless 700C Nickel % _— TBex\est [ 3100
; Non-fading, non- @ 5 NaANL TGO
Embroidery Services Various shrinking rﬁaterial ijj‘}‘ff/‘ (o 20 Mh< <
Non-fading, non- So Shouldar| )
Patches shrinking material rosle MM’ [ AsTe}
Rank Insignia Gold T ox .00
Name Plate Blackington A2450 Gold Higlo Rlacke ntan | 24D
Badge Blackington Gold Higlo 1o /9, oD
Duty Boot Under Armour | 3021036-001 Black Variety of sizes for men and women e A‘-(‘M 745, 0O
Overall Package Price
ADDITIONAL NOTES AND REQUIREMENTS JEP2., <o




RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Bill Print and Mail
Services to the lowest responsive bidder, DATAprose as shown below:

Annual Cost based on 13,500 bills {not
Vendor including postage)
DATAprose S 14,580.00
Financial Imaging S 17,820.00
Standard Printing Company S 18,306.00
Peregrina Solutions S 18,630.00
Iinfosend S 20,250.00
PCI S 47,142.00

Said eBid 2022-6-11277 is located in the County Manager’s Office.



5311 Local Match Certification

The Shelby County Commission representing Shelby County,

hereby certifies to the Alabama Department of Transportation that the required local funds for the
Birmingham Regional Paratransit Consortium dba/ Clastran Public Transportation Program are available
from the following source(s):

General Fund: $130,490.00
Contracts: h) 243.00
Other/Advertising: $
Other: 5
Total: $130,733.00

These funds will be available as of October 1,2022.

-_—

Kevin Morris, Chairperson

Shelby County Commission, Chief Elected Official

ATTEST:

Kim Reynolds, Administrative Assistant to the County Manager

Y=



RESOLUTION 22-07-11-XX
CASE NO. A22-007, Besitos Mexican Kitchen

Transfer — 020 Restaurant Retail Liquor

WHEREAS, Ariel Vicars, Besitos Mexican Kitchen LLC, has submitted documentation in
support of a transfer application request for an 020 — Restaurant Retail Liquor license from Canh
and Vu Pho 280, LLC to Besitos Mexican Kitchen, LLC for the Besitos Mexican Kitchen located
at 5479 Hwy 280, Suite 102, Birmingham, AL, 35242; and,

WHEREAS, Besitos Mexican Kitchen is zoned B-2, General Business District and subject to
the Zoning Ordinance of Shelby County, and,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that an application by Ariel Vicars, Besitos

Mexican Kitchen LLC, for a transfer of 020 — Restaurant Retail Liquor license for Besitos
Mexican Kitchen to permit the retail sale of alcohol at a restaurant is hereby Approved/Denied.

-15-



REPORT TO THE SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION
From the Department of Development Services
Planning Services
July 11, 2022

Case No. A22-007; Besitos Mexican Kitchen
(Transfer — 020 Restaurant Retail Liquor)

ACTION REQUESTED

of a transfer application request for an 020 — Restaurant Retail Liquor license from Canh and \u

The applicant states the restaurant is operating from 11:00 am to 2:30 pm and 5:00 pm to 9:00 pm
Sunday through Friday and 11:00 am to 9:00 pm on Saturday. The applicant confirmed there are
no Sunday alcohol sales before 12 noon.

This facility, Besitos Mexican Kitchen, is located at 5479 Highway 280, Suite 102, Birmingham), AL,
35242; Parcel Identification No. 58-09-3-05-0-001-016.000. The subject property is zoned B-2,

The County Engineer's report has verified the facility is an existing site and has access to U.s.
Highway 280. No drainage problems have been observed on the site,

The Cahaba Valley Fire Department reports the location has an adequate water source to permit
the effective use of firefighting equipment. The facility has adequate personal safety equipment
such as smoke alarms, fire extinguishers, lighted fire exits, and lighted fire exit signs.

Attached is a copy of the definition for an 020 — Restaurant Retail Liquor, as defined in the
Alabama ABC Board Rules and Regulations.

This ABC license application may be approved, denied, or revoked by the State ABC Board,
pending ABI (Alabama Bureay of Investigations) and the FB| (Federal Bureau of Investigations)
results.

-16-



ABC License-020 Restaurant Retail Liquor

020 Restaurant retail liquor license (28-3A-13) — A restaurant liquor license for a hotel, restaurant,
civic center authority or dinner theater which will authorize the licensee to purchase liquor and wine
from the board or as authorized by the board and to purchase table wine and beer, including draft
or keg beer in any county or municipality in which the sale thereof is permitted, from any wholesale
licensee of the board, and in that part of the hotel, restaurant, club or dinner theater set out in the
license, to sell liquor and wine, dispensed from containers of any size, and beer, including draft or
keg beer, in any county or municipality in which the sale thereof is permitted, to the patrons, guests
or members for on-premises consumption in any part of the civic center or in that part of the hotel,
restaurant, or dinner theater habitually used for serving meals to patrons, guests or members, or
other public or private rooms of the building in accordance with the provisions of this chapter and
the regulations made thereunder, and where a restaurant located in a hotel, but not operated by
the owner of the hotel, is licensed to sell alcoholic beverages in the restaurant, it may also sell
alcoholic beverages to guests in private rooms in the hotel.
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ALABAMA ABC BOARD
LICENSE CLASSIFICATIONS

Liquor License Classifications

010 Lounge Retail Liquor — Class |

011 Lounge Retail Liquor — Class II (Package Store)
020 Restaurant Retail Liquor

031 Club Liquor - Class 1

032 Club Liquor — Class II

040 Retail Beer — (On or Off Premises)

050 Retail Beer — (Off Premises Only)

060 Retail Table Wine — (On or Off Premises)
070 Retail Table Wine — (Off Premises Only)
080 Liquor Whole Sale

090 Wholesale Beer Only

100 Wholesale Table Wine Only — 14.9% or Less
110 Wholesale Table Wine & Beer Combined
120 Warehouse License

130 Additional Warehouse — Wine, Beer or Both
140 Special Events Retail

150 Special Retail License — 30 Days or Less
160 Special Retail — More Than 30 Days

170 Retail Common Carrier

200 Manufacturer

210 Importer

220 Brewpub

230 International Motor Speedway

250 Wine Festival License

260 Wine Festival Participant License

500 Direct Wine Shipper

510 Wine Fulfillment Center

520 Additional Wine Fulfillment Center

530 Delivery Service License

800 Off-Site Tasting Permit

-18-
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|Dancing [1 Yes tﬁ( No  Qutdoor Music: O Yes '@/NO

ABC LICENSE APPLICATION
SHELBY COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF DEVELOPMENT SERVICES
(205) 620-6650 - FAX (205) 620-6630 www.shelbyal.com

You must provide the following te submit a complete ABC License Application.

Describe the Principal Primary Function and Inc:dcnlallf‘unclmn of the site:

l{.‘\ \:_‘lui"r t “: =‘_“'i5

Days/Hours of()pczanon (chcck all thal apply): C¥Sun §M T OOW [¥Th [ F [} Sat

Hours: v b [ U0 % 7+ LiveEntertainment: 0O Yes Ei No

If yes, please explain:

Type of Establislatncllt-zéiaeck one): [Al Restaurant O Lodging [ Dinner Theater O

Public Club O Private Club O Retail O Athletic and/or Sports Facility O Bar O
Other, Explain

NOV NT

I, the undersigned Applicant. do hereby certify and declare that the foregoing application was prepared by me and, to
the best of my knowledge, reflects the true aceurate facts pertaining to the information hereinbefore requested. 1, the
undersigned applicant, understand that any false or misleading information contamed within, or presented in
connection with this application may be cause for denial of and or subsequent revocation of the issued license. The
undcrs:gned being duly swum. depascs and snys thal he is the pmon who cxecuted lhls npplacaltcu, tlml the

ngndture of Apphcant ,-| ‘

0  Application 0] Fees
[J  Paper Copy - State f\pphcallon
Application Date: | /| M ) [ A A Type License (Code): |
Project (Trade) I\amc [ ﬁ i (L1 0ai [ 1 '*-;i.l* VATR v itall U LK
Parcel LD.: ()01 ™ (15 () QW B ¥Rl o
Location Address: U7 H\y/ W A%B0 OTE 102 (v OYATARIL Al AShUD
| J }
Applicant Name (Contact Person): }1( ' : TR S -
Company (Applicant): [, S 10N e\ CAN Kl nagi)
Address: ©)1] 10} Hip\ 3 & it 102 [ﬁ)\\ll\l1\fll AV J‘\ .J:J L2
Cell : | [Email: 5 WU i K Cany il g ndé! iy
SITE DATA 5
I-acilty Type (check one): O  Detached Facility ,[31 Attached Facility
The sale and service of alcoholic beverages will be (check one):
0 the principal function of the site [3 an incidental function of the site

Print Name: + (11 \(| (1) - Jonigg,
STATEOF [1\. COUNTY OF (11 7 m; oo “,
Sworn before me this {O¥ day of “Sore Notary: / [/ § "\ aX ‘-._..%’;’
My Commission Expires: G- \3-aoa™ L o“?‘/ O e
Office Use Only S 3 ’\)%\:«‘ :;f
CASENO.: (\IQ - O ] TENTATIVE SCC MEETING DATE: 2 %) P° &3
Relevant Case Nos: Zoning District: ¥.- 34 44 E;AS" \\\‘3‘\
Fees: B(c . C : Transfer? o< i 2t

REVOctobar 2021
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STATE OF ALABAMA

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD
ALCOHOL LICENSE APPLICATION

Confirmation Number: 20220318112638288

Type License: (20 - RESTAURANT RETAIL LIQUOR State: County:
Type License: State: County
Trade Name: BES|ITOS MEXICAN KITCHEN Filing Fee:

Applicant: BESITOS MEXICAN KITCHEN LLC Transfer Fee: $50.00

Location Address: 5479 HWY 280; SUITE 102  BIRMINGHAM, AL 35242

Mailing Address: 5479 HWY 280; SUITE 102 BIRMINGHAM, AL 35242
County: SHELBY  Tobacco sales: NO Tobaceo Vending Machines:

Product Type: Type Ownership:
Book, Page, or Document info: 936-410
Do you sell Draft Beer?:

Date Incorporated: 01/24/2022 State incorporated: p| County Incorporated: CALHOUN
Date of Authority:
Federal Tax ID: 87-4727311 Alabama State Sales Tax ID: R011335606
Name: Title: Date and Place of Birth: Residence Address:
ARIEL HOPE VICARS MERBER 04729/1921 1
{77 oaL ANNISTON, AL cveit
JFSUIR Al FIANDRO OLIVARRES | MEMBER 05/00/1993
i READING, PA 2 A AR
(FIETARNTOPED TEWEER TOITR/1502 z
F : LOS ANGLES, CA C -

Has applicant complied with financial responsibility ABC RR 20-X-5-.14? YES

Dees ABC have any actions pending against the current licensee? NO

Has anyone, including manager or applicant, had a Federal/State permit or license suspended or revoked? NO
Has a liquor, wine, malt or brewed license for these premises ever been denied, suspended, or revoked? NO
Are the applicant(s) named above, the only person(s), in any manner interested in the business sought to be
licensed? YES

Are any of the applicants, whether individual, member of a partnership or association, or officers and
directors of a corporation itself, in any manner monetarily interested, either directly or indirectly, in the
profits of any other class of business regulated under authority of this act? NO

Does applicant own or control, directly or indirectly, hold lien against any real or personal property which is
rented, leased or used in the conduct of business by the holder of any vinous, malt or brewed beverage, or
distilled liquors permit or license issued under authority of this act? NO

Is applicant receiving, either directly or indirectly, any loan, credit, money, or the equivalent thereof from or
through a subsidiary or affiliate or other licensee, or from any firm, association or corporation operating
under or regulated by the authority of this act? NO

Contact Person: ARIEL VICARS Home Phone:

Business Phone: 270-231-5862 Cell Phone: 270~

Fax: E-mﬂil: R R .uu.u\.nﬂ
PREVIOUS LICENSE INFORMATION: Previous License Number(s)

Trade Name: PHO 280 License 1: 011249858

Applicant: CANH AND VU PHO 280 LLC License 2:

5.
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STATE OF ALABAMA

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD
ALCOHOL LICENSE APPLICATION

Confirmation Number: 20220318112638288

[f applicant is leasing the property, is 2 copy of the lease agreement attached? YES

Name of Property owner lessor and phone number: ARBOR PLACE LLC  205-733-1901
What is lessors primary business? REAL ESTATE

Is lessor involved in any way with the alcoholic beverage business? NO

Is there any further interest, or connection with, the licensee’s business by the lessor? NO

Does the premise have a fully equipped kitchen? YES

s the business used to habitually and principally provide food to the public? YES
Does the establishment have restroom facilities? YES

[s the premise equipped with services and facilities for on premises consumption of alcoholic beverages? YES

Will the business be operated primarily as a package store? NO

Building Dimensions Square Footage: 2100 Display Square Footage:

Building seating capacity: 30 Does Licensed premises include a patio area? YES
License Structure: SHOPPING CENTER  License covers: OTHER

Number of licenses in the vicinity: 0 Nearest: 0

Nearest school: 0 miles Nearest church: O miles Nearest residence: 0 miles
Location is within: COUNTY Police protection: COQUNTY

Has any person(s) with any interest, including manager, whether as sole applicant, ofticer, member, or
partner been charged (whether convicted or not) of any law violation(s)?
Name: Violation & Date: Arresting Agency: Dispesition:

& Date ErEST : |
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STATE OF ALABAMA

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD
ALCOHOL LICENSE APPLICATION

Confirmation Number: 20220318112638288

Private Clubs / Special Retail / or Special Events licenses ONLY

Private Club

Does the club charge and collect dues from elected members?

Number of paid up members:

Are meetings regularly held?

How often?

Is business conducted through officers regularly elected?

Are members admitted by written application, investigation, and ballot?

Has Agent verified membership applications for each member listed?

Has at least 10% of members listed been confirmed and highlighted? Agent’s Initials:
For what purpose is the club organized?

Does the property used, as well as the advantages, belong to all the members?

Do the operations of the club benefit any individual member(s), officer(s), director(s), agent(s), or
employee(s) of the club rather than to benefit of the entire membership?

Special Retail
[s it for 30 days or less?
More than 30 days?

Franchisee or Concessionaire of above?
Other valid responsible organization:
Explanation:

Special Events / Special Retail (7 days or less)
Starting Date: Ending Date:
Special terms and conditions for special event/special retail:

Other Explanations
License Covers: SUITE 102
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STATE OF ALABAMA

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD
Confirmation Number: 20220318112638288

NOTICE OF TRANSFER OF ABC LICENSED BUSINESS

NOTE: A Copy of Operating Agreement Must be Attached To Application

CURRENT LICENSEE: NEW APPLICANT:

CANH AND VU PHO 280 LLC BESITOS MEXICAN KITCHEN LLC

Address: 5479 HWY 280; SUITE 102 Address: 5408 HWY 280; SUITE 102
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35242 BIRMINGHAM, AL 35242

Telephone: 205-739-2177 Telephone: 270-231-5862

Current License No: 011249858

LICENSED PREMISES ADDRESS: 5408 HWY 280 BIRMINGHAM, AL 35242

THE AFORENAMED HEREBY SERVE NOTICE TO THE ABC BOARD OF THE ATTACHED
CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT GOVERNING THE CONTINUATION OF SALES OF ALCOHOLIC
BEVERAGES ON THE LICENSED PREMISES.

The Parties to this agreement hereby acknowledge and affirm that the New (Applicant) Licensee will,
at all times, act as the AGENT for the Current (Named) Licensee, and the Current Licensee shall act as
PRINCIPAL for the purposes of the attached Agreement. The Principal shall be bound by all acts and/or
omissions of the Agent in the operation of the licensed premises.

The Current Licensee is now and shall remain liable for any violations of ABC Rules and Regulations
or other Alabama Law for the duration of the attached Agreement; and, further, that the Current Licensee has
the right and authority, under Alabama Law, to surrender the ABC License to the ABC Board at any time.

The parties acknowledge that the operation of the licensed premises shall remain subject to

inspection by ABC Enforcement, and must comply with all State and Local regulations and Laws, and that

the local ABC Enforcement District Office must be immediately notified of any change in the attached
Agreement.

THE CURRENT LICENSE WILL NOT BE RENEWED.
S } ) 1/ " e
WITNESS our hands and seals on this the-.}l, __day of _(Q‘_( 1 ZUJA
CURRENT HECE74EE (NAMED PN LIQENSE) NEW LICENSEE (APPLICANT)
| L[- \ \ o
N VA V4% Visdih I LUnA AN \MC\}: Mo
Print Name"j " 'f_ '_{-;y-.\,-l v T B R Prifyt Name: fﬁ\t’, ATA
Title: W \ ([ [ Tit |2
WITNESS: (By ABC Enforcement) / \ “’ ) (A_, el )_/ .Y D

Revised 9/08 Sl T
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STATE OF ALABAMA

ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE CONTROL BOARD
ALCOHOL LICENSE APPLICATION
Confirmation Number: 20220318112638288

lmtial each Signature page
i ﬂv j In raferance to law violations, | attesl to the truthfulness of the responsas given within the application.
i H}j | In reference to the Leasel/properly ownarship, | attest to the trulhiulness of the responses given within
; the application.
ﬂy" | In reference to ACT No. 80-528, | understand that if my application is denied or discontinued, | will not be

= rafunded the filing fee required by this application.
| Inreferencs to Special Retail or Spacial Events ratail license, | agree to comply with all applicable laws and

regulalions concerning this class of license, and to observe (he special terms and conditions as indicated
__. within the applicalion.

—~

| o ) In reference to the Club Application information, | attest to the truthfulness of the responses given
_ within the application.
1

il

f 7 :
i H\f | Inreference to the transfer of license/lacation, | attest to the truthfulness of the information fisted on the
_, altached transfer agreement.

i : . } in accordance with Alabama Rules & Regulations 20-X-5-.01(4), any social security number disclosed
under this regulation shall be used for the purpose of invastigation or verification by the ABC Board
B and shalil not bs a matter of public record.

; ﬁ\} _' The undersigned agree, if a license is issued as herein applied for, to compiy at all imes with and lo fully
observe all the provisions of the Alabama Alcohalic Beverage Control Act, as appears in Cede of Alabama,
Title 28, and all laws of the State of Alabama relative to the handling of alcaholic beverages.
The undersigned, if issued a license as herain requested, further agrees to obay all rules and regulations
promuigated by lhe board ralative to all aicoholic bevaerages received in this Stats. The undersigned,
if issued a license as herein requested, aiso agrees to allow and hereby invites duly authorized agents of
the Alabama Alcoholic Beverage Cantrol Beard and any duly commissioned law enforcament officer of
the State, County or Municipality in which the license pramises are located lo enter and search without
a warrant the licensad premises or any building owned or accupied by him or her in connection with
said licensed premises. The undersigned hereby understands that he or she violate any provisions of the
aforementioned laws his or her license shall be subject to revocation and no license can be again issued
to said licansee for a period of one year. The undersigned further understands and agrees thal no changes
in the manner of operalion and no deletion or discentinuance of any sewvices or facilities as described in this
application will be allowad without written approval of the proper governing body and the Alabama

—_ Alcohelic Beverage Control Board.

rw 1 | hereby swear and affirm that | have read the application and all statements therein and (acls sel forth are true

and correct, and that the applicant is the only persen interested in the business for which the license
is required.

Applicant Name (print): || || e\ NV CaY 5

Signature of Applicant: !—\} \,\) )| WC(A
Notary Name (print): \/ é h r\Sﬁn

Notary Signature: M (\ L kd W }omm.ssmn exp]res &Q ,&g

Application Taken: App. Inv. Completed: Forwarded to District Office:
Submitted to Local Government: Received from Local Government:
Received in District Office: Reviewed by Supervisor: Forwarded to Central Office:
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