SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION
AUGUST 8, 2016
MINUTES

STATE OF ALABAMA
COUNTY OF SHELBY

The Shelby County Commission of Shelby County, Alabama, met at the County Administration Building in the
City of Columbiana, Alabama, at 8:30 A.M., Monday, August 8, 2016. The meeting was called to order by
Commissioner Shepherd. The invocation was given followed by the Pledge of Allegiance. Roll was called and
the following members were present:

PRESENT
Commissioner Dan Acker
Commissioner Lindsey Allison
Commissioner Elwyn Bearden
Commissioner Tommy Edwards
Commissioner Corley Ellis
Commissioner Robbie Hayes
Commissioner Rick Shepherd
Commissioner Mike Vest

ABSENT
Commissioner Jon Parker

APPROVAL OF MINUTES FROM JULY 25, 2016
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-01

MOTION: Commissioner Ellis - Motion to approve Minutes from July 25, 2016 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Edwards
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

APPROVAL OF BILLS, REQUISITIONS, CHECK REGISTER
GOVERNMENTAL FUNDS AND PROPRIETARY FUNDS
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-02

MOTION: Commissioner Hayes - Motion to approve the Bills, requisitions and check register for
Government and Proprietary Funds as presented

SECOND: Commissioner Acker

VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED



BUDGET FINANCE & LEGAL

BID AWARDS

UNIFORM SHIRTS AND JACKETS
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-03

MOTION: Commissioner Hayes — Motion to approve Resolution 16-08-08-03 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Acker
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 16-08-08-03

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Uniform Shirts and Jackets
to the overall lowest responsive bidder, American Osment/Promo as shown on the attached bid tabulation.

Said eBid #2016-7-1852 is located within the County Manager’s Office.

AWARD BID - PRESSURE SEAL FORMS
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-04

MOTION: Commissioner Hayes — Motion to approve Resolution 16-08-08-04 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Acker
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 16-08-08-04

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Pressure Seal Forms to the
lowest responsive bidder, R.R. Donnelly as shown on the attached tabulation. The water forms provided as
samples by Nelson Printing did not perform up to standards when fed through the printer.

Said eBid #2016-6-10848 is located within the County Manager’s Office.

BID AWARD — COUNTY ADMINISTRATION BUILDING ROOFING & HVAC RENOVATION
PROJECT AND RELATED ACTIONS
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-05

MOTION:  Commissioner Hayes — Motion to approve Resolution 16-08-08-05 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Allison
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

RESOLUTION 16-08-08-05

The Shelby County Commission hereby records and approves the bid award made by the County Manager to
Douglas Built, the lowest responsive bid for the County Administration Building Roofing and HVAC Renovation
Project. The attached bid tabulation and project signage is hereby recorded as part of this resolution.

RESOLVED, the project and all associated expenses shall be covered by the County Government Capital
Improvement Fund (Fund #116).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that pursuant to Resolution 15-11-09-05, Section 2, effective on September 12,

2016, Shelby County Commission meetings will be located in the Harrison Regional Library Building, 50 Lester

Street, Columbiana, Alabama 35051 “Mildred B. Harrison Library Building” for the period necessary with the

renovation project. The County Commission meetings will return to the County Administration Building upon the
-2-



completion of all work associated with the project. The attached signage will be posted on the project construction
fencing and is hereby made a part of this resolution. The County Manager is directed to take any actions
necessary with this project.

PUBLIC SAFETY, COURTS & ELECTION
VOTING - ELECTRONIC P OLL BOOKS PROJECT - CONSENT
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-06

MOTION: Commissioner Bearden — Motion to approve Resolution 16-08-08-06 as presented
SECOND: Commissioner Allison
VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED

Resolution 16-08-08-06
of the
County Commission of Shelby County, Alabama

WHEREAS, the Alabama Legislature adopted Act No. 2016-317 which is effective August 1,
2016 (Act No. 2016-317); and

WHEREAS, Act No. 2016-317 allows the Alabama Secretary of State to implement a project
regarding the use of electronic poll books in lieu of the printed lists of qualified voters (the Project)
provided for in Section 17-4-2 of the Ala. Code and the poll lists provided for in Sections 17-9-11 and
17-13-7 of the Ala. Code; and

WHEREAS, in order for a county to participate in the Project the consent of both the County
Commission and the Judge of Probate must be provided; and

WHEREAS, for the November 8, 2016 Statewide General Election, the Project is intended to be
limited in scope for participating counties whereby only a certain number of electronic poll books shall
be used in only a limited number of voting precincts per participating county; and

WHEREAS, both the County Commission and Judge of Probate evidence their mutual consent to
participate in the Project for the November 8, 2016 Statewide General Election and wish to memorialize
this approval by this instrument; now therefore

BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION, That we hereby consent to
participate in the Project during the November 8, 2016 Statewide General Election in the county.

MOTION TO ADJOURN
RESOLUTION 16-08-08-07

MOTION: Commissioner Hayes — There being no further business to come before the Commission, move
to adjourn this 8th™ day of August, 2016 at 9:02 A.M.

SECOND: Commissioner Ellis

VOTE ON MOTION: Unanimous MOTION CARRIED
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Uniform Shirts and Jackets
Ebid# 2016-7-10852

BG-7227 Blue Generation
Men's Tonal Stripe Wicking
Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4X

5X

6X

Tall Sizes
MCK01263 Cutter & Buck
Men's Dry Tec Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4X

5X

6X

Tall Sizes
K420 Port Authority Men's
Cotton Pique Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4%

5X

6X

Tall Sizes
BG-8213S Blue Generation
Men's Short Sleeve Button
Down

Cintas

$16.65
$18.32
$21.65
$23.32
$24.99
$26.65
No bid

$32.50
$32.50
$32.50
No bid
No bid
No bid
$42.50

$16.15
$17.77
$21.00
$22.62
$25.85
$27.47
$17.77

American
Promo

$7.19
57.82
$9.05
$9.69
$10.32
$10.94
+52.00/size

$24.38
$25.01
$25.63
No bid
No bid
No bid
+$7.50/size

$12.48
$13.10
$14.36
$14.98
$16.23
$16.86
No bid

Ad-Wear
&
Specialty

$11.49
512.64
$14.93
$16.09
$17.23
$18.39
No bid

$22.41
$22.41
$22.41
No bid
No bid
No bid
$29.31

$11.49
$12.63
$14.93
$16.09
$18.39
$19.53
No bid

Sayre

$13.29
$14.62
$17.28
$18.61
$19.94
$21.27
No bid

$25.94
$25.94
$25.94
No bid
No bid
No bid
+$7.98

$13.29
$14.62
$17.28
$18.61
$19.94
$21.27
No bid

Shelby
Printing

$22.97
$25.97
$29.87
$32.17
$34.47
$36.77
No bid

$54.07
$54.07
$54.07
$67.85
No bid
No bid
No bid

$11.48
$12.63
$14.93
$16.08
$18.38
$19.53
Varies

Garments Specified in Bid

NAFECO

$14.75
$16.25
$19.00
$20.50
$22.00
$23.50
No bid

$28.75
$28.75
$28.75
$37.50
$37.50
No bid
$37.50

$14.75
$16.25
$19.00
§20.50
$23.50
$25,00
No bid

Southern
Nameplate

$13.00
$14.30
$16.90
$18.20
$19.50
$20.80
No bid

$25.35
§25.35
$25.35
$33.15
No bid
No bid
$33.15

$12.99
$14.29
$16.89
$18.19
$20.79
$22.09
No bid

Express
Press

$12.33
$13.02
$15.30
§16.45
$17.59
$18.74
No bid

§22.75
§22.75
$22.75
No bid
No bid
No bid
$29.61

$12.33
$13.02
515.30
$16.45
$18.74
$19.88
No bid

Uniforms Nelson Print &

mfg

$11.69
$12.86
$15.20
$16.37
$17.54
$18.71
No bid

$22.82
$22.82
$22.82
$29.84
$29.84
$29.84
$29.84

$11.69
$12.86
$15.20
$16.37
$18.71
$19.88
No bid

Promo

$13.32
$15.98
$21.32
$23.98
$26.65
$29.32
No bid

$26.00
$26.00
$26.00
No bid
No bid
No bid

+ 5$6.00/shirt

$13.32
$14.65
$17.32
$18.65
$21.32
$22.65
+$1.00

Cole
Enterprise

§11.85
$12.85
$14.85
$15.85
$17.85
518.85
No bid

$22.00
$22.00
$22.00
$28.60
$28.60
No bid
Varies

$11.95
$12.95
$14.95
§15.95
$17.95
$18.95
No bid

MAC Uniform (Bid
Garment Specified in Bid Bob Barker
and Alternates)

Bid
Alternate

Bid
Alternate

$15.50
$17.00
$20.00
$21.50
$24.00
$25.50
Varies

$20.50
522.00
$25.00
$26.50
No bid
No bid
No bid

$12.00
$13.50
$16.50
$18.00
$20.00
$21.50
Varies

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

Alternate Items

$24.60
$24.60
$24.60
$24.60
$24.60
No bid
No bid

$12.40
$12.40
$12.40
$15.40
$15.40
No bid
No bid

$27.90
$27.90
$27.90
$27.90
$27.90
No bid
No bid

American
Soccer

$15.95
$17.95
$19.95
$21.95
$23.95
$25.95
$2.00/inch

$10.50
$12.50
$14.50
$16.50
$18.50
$20.50
$2.00/inch

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid



Small - X-Large

2X

3X

ax

5X

6X

Tall Sizes
BG-8213 Blue Generation
Men's Long Sleeve Button
Down

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

ax

5X

6X

Tall Sizes
RH37 Red House Men's Non-
Iron Long Sleeve Button
Down

Small - X-Large
2X

3X

4X

Tall Sizes

BG-9951 Blue Generation
Men's Full Zip Jacket

Small - X-Large
2X

3X

ax

5X

6X

Tall Sizes

$18.32
$19.99
$23.32
$24.99
$26.65
$28.32
No bid

$18.32
$19.99
$23.32
$24.99
$26.65
$28.32
$24.15

$43.65
$45.27
$48.50
$50.12
$45.27

$26.65
$30.82
$32.07
$36.24
$43.32
No bid
No bid

$7.81
$8.44
$9.06
$10.31
$10.93
$11.56
+$2.00/size

$7.81
$8.44
$9.06
$10.31
$10.93
$11.56
+$2.00/size

$30.00
$30.63
$30.63
$30.63
+$2.50/size

$11.40
$12.03
$12.65
$13.90
$14.52
$15.15
+$2.00/size

$12.63
$13.89
$14.43
$17.69
$19.93
$25.27
No bid

$12.63
$13.89
$14.43
$17.69
$19.93
$25.27
No bid

$31.03
$32.17
$34.47
$35.63
No bid

$18.39
$20.21
§23.89
$25.73
$27.57
$36.77
No bid

$14.62
$15.95
$18.61
$19.94
$21.27
$22.60
$23.93

$14.62
$15.95
$18.61
$19.94
$21.27
$22.60
+5$3.50

$35.91
$37.24
$39.90
$41.23
No bid

$21.27
$22.60
$25.26
$26.59
$27.92
$29.25
No bid

$25.97
$27.57
$32.17
$34.47
$36.77
$39.07
No bid

$25.97
$27.57
$32.17
$34.47
$36.77
$39.07
No bid

$31.07
$32.25
$34.50
$35.65
Varies

$36.77
§42.52
$44.25
$50.00
$59.77
$59.77
No bid

$16.25
§17.75
$20.50
$22.00
$23.50
$25.00
$26.50

$16.25
$17.75
$20.50
$22.00
$23.50
$27.75
$25.75

$39.75
$41.00
$44.00
$45.50
No bid

$23.50
$27.25
$28.25
$32.00
$38.25
$38.25
No bid

$14.30
$15.60
$18.20
$19.50
$20.80
$22.10
No bid

$14.30
$15.60
$18.20
$19.50
$20.80
$22.10
$3.25

$35.10
$36.40
$39.00
$40.30
No bid

$20.80
$24.05
$25.01
$28.26
$33.79
$33.79
No bid

$13.02
$14.16
$16.45
$17.59
$18.74
$19.88
$21.02

$13.02
$14.16
$16.45
$17.59
$18.74
$19.88
Varies

$31.33
$32.47
$34.76
$35.91
No bid

$18.74
$21.60
$22.46
$25.32
$30.18
$30.18
No bid

$12.86
$14.03
$16.37
$17.54
$18.71
$19.88
No bid

512.86
$14.03
516.37
$17.54
$18.71
$19.88
$20.46

$31.59
$32.76
$35.10
$36.27
No bid

$18.71
$21.63
$22.51
$25.44
530.41
$30.41
No bid

$14.65
$16.12
$19.05
$20.52
$21.98
$29.30
No bid

$14.65
$16.12
$19.05
$20.50
$21.98
$29.30

+ $3.50/shirt

$36.00
$37.33
$40.00
$41.33

+ $1.00/shirt

$21.32
$23.45
$27.70
$29.85
$32.00
$42.64
No bid

$12.99
$13.99
$15.99
$16.99
$18.99
$20.99
No bid

$12.99
$13.99
$15.99
$16.99
$18.99
$21.79
No bid

$30.00
$31.00
$33.00
$34.00
No bid

$18.49
$19.49
$21.49
$22.49
$24.49
$25.49
No bid

Bid
Alternate

Bid
Alternate

$41.80
$43.30
$46.00
$47.50
Varies

Bid
Alternate

$28.00
$29.50
$31.00
$32.50
$34.00
$35.50
Varies

$29.00
$30.50
$32.00
$33.50
$35.00
$36.50
Varies

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

$22.00
$23.50
$26.50
$28.00
$30.00
$31.50
Varies

$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
No bid

$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
$22.90
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$21.80
$21.80
$21.80
$21.80
$21.80
$21.80
$21.80

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid



1764 Port Authority Men's
Legacy Jacket

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4x

5X

6X

Tall Sizes

BG-6229 Blue Generation
Ladies Wicking Polo

Small - X-Large
2X
3X
4X

L510 Port Authority Ladies
Stain-Resisitant Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4X
L800 Port Authority Ladies
Pique Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4X
LOG105 Ogio Ladies Polo

Small - X-Large

2X

3X

4X
L562 Port Authority Ladies
3/4 Sleeve Polo

$38.78
$40.40
$43.63
$45,25
$48.48
$50.10
$42.02

$12.65
$14.32
$17.65
$19.32

$14.53
$16.15
$19.38
$21.00

$19.38
$21.00
$24.23
$25.85

$36.65
$38.32
$41.65
$43.32

$30.00
$30.63
$31.25
$31.88
$33.12
$33.75
No bid

$5.62
$6.25
$6.87
$8.12

$11.25
$11.88
$13.15
$13.75

$14.98
$15.61
516.23
$16.86

$27.49
$28.12
$28.74
$29.37

§27.57
$28.73
$32.53
$32.17
$34.47
$35.63
No bid

$7.91
$9.05
$11.35
$12.51

$10.33
§11.49
$13.79
$13.79

$13.79
$14.93
$17.23
$19.53

$25.27
$26.43
$28.73
$31.03

$31.91
$33.24
$35.90
$37.23
$39.89
$41.22
No bid

$10.09
$11.42
$14.08
$15.41

$11.96
$13.29
$15.95
$17.28

$15.95
$17.28
$19.94
$21.27

$29.25
$30.58
$33.24
$34.57

$27.58
$28.73
$31.03
$32.18
$34.48
$35.53
Varies

$17.45
$19.75
$24.35
$26.65

$10.33
$11.48
$13.78
$14.93

$13.78
$14.93
$17.23
$18.38

$25.28
$26.43
$28.73
$29.88

$35.25
$36.75
$39.50
$41.00
$44.00
$45.50
No bid

$11.25
$12.75
$15.50
$17.00

$13.25
$14.75
$17.75
$19.00

$§17.75
$19.00
$22.00
$23.50

$32.25
$33.75
$36.75
$38.25

$31.20
$32.50
$35.10
$36.40
$39.00
$40.30
No bid

$9.87
51117
$13.77
$15.07

$11.70
$13.00
$15.60
$16.90

$15.60
$16.90
$19.50
$20.80

$28.60
$29.90
$32.50
$33.80

$27.89
$29.03
$31.32
$32.46
$34.75
$35.90
No bid

$9.13
$10.27
$12.56
$13.70

$10.73
$12.33
$14.16
$15.30

$14.16
$15.30
$17.59
$18.74

$25.60
$26.74
$29.03
$30.18

$28.07
$29.24
$31.58
$32.75
$35.09
$36.26
$34.49

$8.88
$10.05
$12.39
$13.56

$10.52
$11.69
$14.03
$15.20

$14.03
$15.20
$17.54
$18.71

$25.73
$26.90
$29.24
$30.41

$31.98
$33.32
$35.98
$37.32
$39.98
$41.32

+ $2.00/shirt

$10.12
$12.78
$18.12
$20.78

$11.98
$13.32
$15.98
$17.32

$15.98
$17.32
$19.98
$21.32

$29.32
$30.65
$33.32
$34.65

$26.75
$27.75
$29.75
$30.75
$32.75
$33.75
No bid

$9.29
$10.29
$12.29
$13.29

$10.79
$11.79
$13.79
$14.79

$13.95
$14.95
$16.95
$17.95

$24.69
$25.69
$27.69
$28.69

$36.90
$38.40
$41.00
$42.50
$45.00
$46.50
Varies

Bid
Alternate

$15.20
$16.70
$19.50
$21.00

$19.50
$21.00
$24.00
$25.50

$33.90
$35.40
$38.00
$39.50

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

$12.50
$14.00
$17.00
$18.50

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$23.90
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$28.50
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$39.95
$41.95
$43.95
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$15.95
$17.95
$19.95
$21.95

§10.50
$12.50
$14.50
$16.50

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$15.95
$17.95
$19.95
$21.95



Small - X-Large
22X
3X
ax

LOG122 Ogio Ladies 3/4

Sleeve Polo
Small - X-Large
2X
3X
ax

BG-4701 Blue Generation

Ladies Cardigan

Small - X-Large
2X
3X
4x

BG-6951 Blue Generation

Ladies Full Zip Jacket

Small - X-Large
2X
3X
4x

L764 Port Authority Ladies

Legacy Jacket
Small - X-Large
2X
3X
4x

Embroidery Logo 1A - Two

Lines

Embroidery Logo 1B - Three

Lines

Embroidery Logo 2 - Seal

with One Line

$17.77
$19.38
$22.62
$24.23

$31.65
$33.32
$36.65
$38.32

$18.32
$19.99
$23.32
$24.99

$26.65
$30.82
532.07
$36.24

$38.78
$40.40
$43.63
$45.25

$1.90

$2.16

$2.16

$13.74
$14.37
$14.99
$15.62

$18.99
$19.62
$20.87
$21.49

$7.81
$8.44
$9.06
$10.31

$11.40
$12.03
$12.65
$13.90

$29.99
$30.62
$31.24
$31.87
$1.25
$1.25

$1.25

$12.63
$13.79
$16.09
$18.39

$21.83
$22.97
$25.27
$26.43

$12.63
$13.79
$16.09
$17.23

$18.39
$20.21
$23.89
$25.73

$27.57
$28.73
$31.03
$32.17
$5.00
$5.00

$5.00

$14.62
$15.95
$18.61
$19.94

$25.26
$26.59
$29.25
$30.58

$14.62
$15.95
$18.61
$19.94

$21.27
$22.60
$25.26
$26.59

$31.91
$§33.24
$35.90
$37.23
$1.65
$1.75

$2.50

$12.63
$13.78
$16.08
$17.23

$21.83
$22.98
$25.28
$26.43

$25.27
$27.57
$32.17
$34.47

$36.77
$42.52
$44.25
$50.00

$27.58
$28.73
$31.03
$32.18
$3.50
$3.50

$4.50

$16.25
$17.75
$20.50
$22.00

$27.75
$29.50
$32.25
$33.75

$16.25
$17.75
$22.00
$23.50

$23.50
$27.25
$28.25
$31.75

$35.25
$36.75
$39.50
$41.00
$4.50
$5.50

$3.75

$14.30
$15.60
$18.20
$19.50

$24.70
$26.00
$28.60
$29.90

$14.30
$15.60
$18.20
$19.50

$20.80
$24.05
$25.03
$28.26

$31.20
$32.50
$35.10
$36.40
$2.50
$3.00

$3.50

$13.02
$14.16
$16.45
$17.59

$22.17
$23.31
$25.60
$26.74

$13.02
$14.16
$16.45
$17.59

$18.74
$21.60
$§22.46
$25.32

$27.89
$29.03
$31.32
$32.46
$2.00
$2.00

$3.00

$12.86
$14.03
$16.37
$17.54

$22.22
$23.39
$25.73
$26.90

$12.86
$14.03
$16.37
$17.54

518.71
$21.63
§22.51
$25.43

$28.07
$29.24
$31.58
$32.75
$2.50
$2.50

$3.00

$14.65
$15.98
$18.65
$19.98

$25.32
$26.65
$29.32
$30.65

$14.65
$17.32
$22.65
$25.32

$21.32
$23.42
$27.72
$29.85

$31.98
$33.32
$35.98
$37.32
$3.65
$3.65

$4.65

$12.89
$13.89
$15.89
$16.89

$21.49
$22.49
$24.49
$25.49

$12.95
$13.95
$15.95
$16.95

$18.25
$20.45
$21.20
$23.70

$26.95
$27.95
$29.95
$30.95
$2.00
$2.00

$3.50

$17.00
$18.50
$21.00
$22.50

$29.50
$31.00
$34.00
$35.50

Bid
Alternate

Bid
Alternate

$36.90
$38.40
$41.00
$42.50
$3.00
$3.50

$5.00

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid

$20.50
$22.00
$25.00
$26.50

$22.00
$23.50
$26.50
$28.00

Bid
Garment
Specified in
Bid
$3.00
$3.50

$5.00

$15.99
$15.99
$15.99
$15.99

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
$2.65
$2.65

$3.84

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

$39.95
$41.95
$43.95
No bid
$7.00
$7.00

$7.00



Forms Bid Analysis

Bids submitted : 6

Smart Source 216 Aquarius Dr Suite 310 Bham, AL 35209 205-942-3150
Maridan Corp PO Box 1748 Pelham, AL 35124 205.989.1699
Forms Plus P O Box 25343 Charlotte, NC 28229 704-535-3500
Walker Group 6616 N W 115th St #100 Ok City, OK 73162 314-329-6193
RR Donnelly 2100 River Haven Dr Ste 200 Birmingham, AL 35244 205.733.1335
Nelson Printing 1068 1st S5t S Alabaster, AL 35007 205-540-3708
G 2 by S ~ Smart Source Maridan Corp Forms Plus ~ Walker Group R R Donnelly _ Nelson Printing
SShmmany Degte| i Qrer Quantityg Cost/M Total Cost/M Total Cost/M Total Cost/M Total Cost/M | Total | Cost/M | Total
3 125,000 $36.44 $4,555.00 $34.16 $4,270.00 $31.25 $3,906.25 $28.57 $3,607.00 $26.69 $3,336.00 $28.25 $3,531.25
ettt el et | FIG 250,000 $33.40 $8,350.00 $31.90 $7,975.00 | $2815 | $7,037.50 | 52856 | 57,4000 | $24.46 | $6,115.00 | $24.50 | $6,225.00
8.5X11 Generic Pressure Sealed Form w/text License 160,000 $35.16 $5,626.00 $33.23 $5,316.80 $31.50 $5,040.00 $29.00 $4,640.00 $27.75 $4,120.00 $26.75 $4,280.00
8.5 Pressure Sealed Form w/ return envelope Water 130,000 $46.35 $6,026.00 $43.84 $5,699.20 $44.30 $5,759.00 $42.73 $5,555.00 $41.21 | $5,357.00 | $39.25 | $5,102.50
8.5X11 Tag Receipt License 250,000 $18.32 $4,581.00 $17.00 $4,250.00 $22.10 $5,525.00 $12.20 $3,050.00 514.86 $3,714.00 $13.50 $3,375.00
TOTAL COST : $29,138.00 $27,511.00 $27,267.75 $23,992.00 $22,642.00 $22,513.75
* Red indicates lowest bid for form type and
overall lowest total bid
Bid Evaluation:
The main criteria used for evaluating and comparing submitted bids include price, quality, and lead time for product delivery.
Contributing Factors:
*Nelson Printing supplied the lowest overall price but Water Dept. form-
form with envelope- did not perform up to standards also did not send the correct EZ fold form to test.
*Only received Water Dept. form from Forms Plus
*R R Donnelly supplied lowest price for PTC Dept. forms and license tag receipts and all forms performed well.
g Criteria [1to 5 scale] ~ Smart Source’ _ Maridan Corp ~ FormsPlus Walker Group ~ RR Donnelly Nelson Printing
Price 1 2 3 4 5 5
Quality 5 3 0 5 5 3
Lead Time 4 5 4 4 5 5
References 5 5 5 5

Recommendation:

Comments:

*R R Donnelly samples performed as well or better than all other forms submitted.
*R R Donnelly meets the bid terms and specifications for all production and delivery following proof approval.
*Text must be updated on Water Department form




BID TABULATION Shelby County Administration Roofing & HVAC Renovation
July 21, 2016 2:00pm Shelby County, Alabama
SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION

BIDD ER Douglas Built P&M Mechanical Trawick Contractors Wayne Davis Construction
Add $54,542 to Base Bid

Add $85,000 to Base Bid Deduct Add $7994 to Alternate 2
Envelope Notation None $15,000 to Alternate 3 Add $9314 to Alternate 3 None
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes
Base Bid 1,024,202.00 1,103,000.00 1,500,000.00 1,038,799.00
Estimated Sales Tax 20,408.00 25,536.00 65,500.00 70,000.00
Alternate #1 31,372.00 35,000.00 31,371.00 29,183.00
Estimated Sales Tax 1,880.00 960.00 1,880.00 1,880.00
Alternate #2 14,304.00 17,806.00 15,609.00 20,658.00
Estimated Sales Tax 910.00 410.00 910.00 1,350.00
Alternate #3 54,963.00 77,000.00 58,727.00 52,014.00
Estimated Sales Tax 1,200.00 2,241.00 2,349.00 3,500.00
Alternate #4 33,600.00 33,238.00 40,364.00 30,800.00
Estimated Sales Tax 650.00 650.00 2,000.00 650.00
Alternate #5 91,330.00 90,372.00 77,797.00 83,743.00
Estimated Sales Tax 6,600.00 6,600.00 6,000.00 6,600.00
Alternate #6 29,700.00 30,657.00 24,000.00 45,000.00
Estimated Sales Tax 0.00 802.00 960.00 3,000.00
Alternate #7 4,500.00 4,154.00 1,127.00 2,750.00
Estimated Sales Tax 275.00 275.00 60.00 100.00

I hereby certify that this is a true tabulation of bids received by the Shelby County Commission on July 21, 2016 at 2:00pm for the Shelby County Administration Building Renovation

SHELBY COUNTY COMMISSION

By: Reed Prince
Manager, Facilities &



SHELBY COUNTY ADMINISTRATION BUILDING OFFICES HAVE BEEN TEMPORARILY RELOCATED

Office Building Name Temporary Physical Address Phone Number
PERSONNEL SERVICES Frank C. “Butch” Ellis Community Services 100 West College St., Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6510
ACCOUNTING:

COMMISSION, ENVIRONMENTAL & WATER 202 West College 202 West College St., Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6530
CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER 202 West College 202 West College St., Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6505
BUSINESS REVENUE OFFICE 202 West College 202 West College St., Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6520
WATER SERVICES - FIELD OPERATIONS South Shelby Water Filtration Plant 7935 Highway 61, Wilsonville, AL 35186 205-670-6540
COMMUNITY SERVICES Ray 1st Floor, 504 Highway 70, Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6555
COUNTY MANAGER Ray 1st Floor, 504 Highway 70, Columbiana, AL 35051 205-670-6500

The Shelby County Commission Meeting Room is located in the adjacent
Mildred B. Harrison Library Building at 50 Lester St., Columbiana, AL 35051. —

COUNTY ADMINISTRATION BUILDING CLOSED
DUE TO ROOFING & HVAC PROJECT

SHELBYAL.COM



RESOLUTION NO. 15-11-09-05

WHEREAS, each of the hereinafter designated buildings and premises are owned by
Shelby County, Alabama, a political subdivision of the State of Alabama, and are each,
separately and severally, located within the city limits of the City of Columbiana, Shelby
County, Alabama, which is the County Seat of Shelby County; and

WHEREAS, each of the hereinafter described buildings and premises and facilities house
various public activities associated with the official governmental functions of Shelby County,
all as authorized by the Constitution of the State of Alabama and the authority derived therefrom
and from the Acts of the Legislature of the State of Alabama; and

WHEREAS, the Shelby County Commission, as the governing body of Shelby County,
has and does hereby determine that each of the following buildings and the premises upon which
the same are located within the city limits of the City of Columbiana, Alabama, should
separately and severally be designated as an official Annex to the Shelby County Courthouse:

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE SHELBY COUNTY
COMMISSION AS FOLLOWS:

1. That in addition to the County Administration Building located at 200 West
College Street, Columbiana, Alabama, which was designated as an official Annex to the Shelby
County Courthouse in Resolution of the Shelby County Commission Number 95-04-10-11, the
following buildings and premises upon which the same are located are hereby each, separately
and severally, designated as an additional official Annex to the Shelby County Courthouse:

@) Property Tax Commission Building
102 Depot Street, Columbiana, AL 35051

(ii)  The Shelby County License Office, Columbiana Branch
104 Depot Street, Columbiana, AL 35051

(iii)  Shelby County Public Defender Annex
108 North Main Street, Columbiana, AL 35051, and
110 North Main Street, Columbiana, AL 35051

(iv)  The John E. Jones Agri-Center Building
54 Kelly Lane, Columbiana, AL 35051

) The Frank C. “Butch” Ellis, Jr. Community Services Building
100 West College Street, Columbiana, AL 35051

(vi)  Harrison Regional Library Building
50 Lester Street, Columbiana, AL 35051



(vii)  Shelby County Highway Department
506 Highway 70, Columbiana, AL 35051

(viii) 1854 Old Courthouse / Historical Society
1854 Main Street
Columbiana, AL 35051

(ix) Ray Building
(County Highway, Environmental Services & Emergency Management)
504, 506, 510 Highway 70, Columbiana, AL 35051

2. That from time to time, as deemed necessary by the Shelby County Commission,
in order to meet scheduling and other problems surrounding the meetings of the County
Commission, the Shelby County Commission may hold either its regularly scheduled
Commission Meetings, as well as special called meetings, in designated portions of Harrison
Regional Library and/or any of the other above designated Courthouse Annexes upon the
adoption of an appropriate resolution to such effect and provided that legal notice of such
meeting is given, as provided by law, to the press and general public.

CERTIFICATE
I, the undersigned, Kim Reynolds, Administrative Assistant II to the County Manager, do

hereby certify that the above and foregoing Resolution is a certified copy of a Resolution
adopted _by the Shelby County Commission at its regular meeting on

v 49 , 2015.

Kim Reynolds, Adphisftive Assistant I1
to the County Manager




